Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2022 Material Bid Tabulations
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Bid Item 2022-01 Signs and Posts
Item Description Unit
Signs
Sign, Type llIA Sft 7.18 10.00
Sign, Type IIIB Sft 7.18 10.50
Sign, Type VB Sft No Bid 12.00
3 LB/FT STEEL POST
45 FT "/ea" 13.46 No Bid
6 FT "/ea" 17.34 No Bid
7FT "/ea" 20.23 No Bid
8FT "/ea" 23.12 No Bid
9FT "/ea" 26.00 No Bid
10 FT "/ea" 28.90 No Bid
11FT "/ea" 31.79 No Bid
12 FT "/ea" 34.68 No Bid
13 FT "/ea" 37.57 No Bid
14 FT "/ea" 40.46 No Bid
15FT "/ea" 43.35 No Bid
16 FT "/ea" 46.24 No Bid
3 LB/FT GALVANIZED STEEL POST
45FT "/ea" 17.00 No Bid
6 FT "/ea" 22.68 No Bid
7FT "/ea" 26.46 No Bid
8FT "/ea" 30.24 No Bid
9FT "/ea" 34.02 No Bid
10 FT "/ea" 37.80 No Bid
11FT "/ea" 41.58 No Bid
12 FT "/ea" 45.36 47.65
13 FT "/ea" 49.14 51.60
14 FT "/ea" 52.92 55.60
1SFT "/ea" 56.70 59.75
16 FT "/ea" 60.48 63.85
SPECIALTY POSTS
7' Steel Delineator Post "/ea" *9.16 ~12.00
6' Flexible Delineator Post w/ 3"x12" HIP Sheeting "/ea" *%*21.93 ~~ 28.80
PLASTIC DRUM, FLUORESCENT, FURN
Plastic Drum, Fluorescent, Furn "/ea" 88.71 86.15

* Galvanized Post
** Tri-Flex Marker

~ Must order in bundles of 100

~~ Must order in boxes of 10, specify color of sheeting. Sheeting comes in separate package.

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on January 4th, 2022 at 3:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on January 6th, 2022 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2022-02 Dust Control and Anti-Icing Product
Item Description Rate
YETIE - - - - T
Applied County 38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Applied Continuous /gal
Wide - - - -
Mineral Well Brine Applied Continuous "/gal" 0.178
YETIE - - - T
Bulk Delivery to 38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Delivered /gal
MCRC Sanford - - -
Mineral Well Brine Delivered "/gal" 0.157
38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Picked up at Terminal "/gal"
Material Only
Mineral Well Brine Picked up at Terminal "/gal" 0.075
* Based on 9,500
gallon loads
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Bid Item 2022-03 Guardrail
Item Description Rate
Steel Beam Guardrail Materials and Installation
Guardrail, Rem "/ 32.00 20.00
Guardrail, Curved, Type B "/ 175.00 45.00
Guardrail, Curved, Type T "/ 230.00 58.00
Guardrail, Type B "/t 125.00 45.00
Guardrail, Type T Viis 160.00 58.00
Guardrail, Type MGS-8 "/t 125.00 45.00
Guardrail Post, Culv "/ea" 900.00 650.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 1B "/ea" 5,800.00 3,975.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 1T "/ea" 6,100.00 4,300.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2B "/ea" 6,300.00 4,400.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2T "/ea" 6,600.00 4,750.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2M "/ea" 6,600.00 4,725.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 3B "/ea" 8,300.00 7,475.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 3T "/ea" 8,600.00 8,025.00
Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type B "fea" 2,975.00 1,525.00
Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type T "/ea" 3,150.00 1,750.00
Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type MGS "/ea" 3,075.00 1,500.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M1 "/ea" 6,800.00 6,150.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M2 "/ea" 7,150.00 6,675.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M3 "/ea" 7,300.00 7,075.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M4 "/ea" 7,075.00 6,300.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M5 "/ea" 7,475.00 7,300.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M6 "/ea" 7,550.00 7,575.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M7 "/ea" 7,200.00 7,050.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M8 "/ea" 7,550.00 7,575.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M9 "/ea" 7,650.00 7,850.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T1 "/ea" 7,900.00 3,875.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T2 "/ea" 8,150.00 4,275.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T3 "/ea" 8,850.00 4,600.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T4 "/ea" 8,125.00 3,575.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T5 "/ea" 8,575.00 4,900.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T6 "/ea" 8,250.00 4,500.00
Guardrail Anch, Median "/ea" 5,375.00 7,350.00
Guardrail Reflector "fea" 19.85 8.75
Item 3.b. Nu-Guard-31 Roadside Barrier Mat & Install
Nu-Guard Rib-Bak, 5 Ib. x 6.5' "/ea" 225.00 225.00
Nu-Guard Rib-Bak, 5 |b. x 8.5' "/ea" 265.00 250.00
Nu-Guard, Washer, 3.5" D "/ea" 6.00 8.00
Nu-Guard-31 System, Installation County Wide Per
. Viis 125.00 70.00
Lineal Ft.
Awarded Items
Sealed bids were opened on January 4th, 2022 at 3:00 pm
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Bid Item 2022-04 Brush Spray
Item Description Rate
Brush Control "/Gallon" 1.35 1.32 1.25
Cattail Control "/Gallon" 1.40 2.74 3.92
Phragmites Control "/Gallon" 1.75 2.74 3.92
Japanese Knotweed Control "/Gallon" 1.40 2.74 3.92
Guardrail Vegetation Control Viis 0.08 0.08 0.18
Awarded Items
Sealed bids were opened on January 4th, 2022 at 3:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on January 6th, 2022 at 9:00 am Page 4
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2022-05 PIPE
Item Description Rate
Item 5.a. Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe *
12" Viis 6.70
15" Viis 8.20
18" Viis 11.90
24" Viis 20.09
30" Viis 29.76
36" Viis 37.35
48" Viis 63.88
54" Viis No Bid
60" Viis 83.15
Item 5.b. Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe — Perforated w/ Sock
12" Viis 7.84
15" Viis 9.56
18" Vi 13.80
24" Viis 22.39
30" Vi 33.04
36" Viis 41.29
Item 5.c. Aluminized Type Il Corrugated Metal Pipe *x HoEE ~
12" Vi 17.10 22.20 19.11
15" Viis 21.05 27.75 23.76
18" Vi 25.45 33.30 28.43
24" Viis 34.40 44.40 36.50
30" Vi 43.30 56.10 47.13
36" Viis 52.25 68.40 70.18
48" Viis 76.00 91.20 91.99
54" Vi 121.00 135.50 100.90
60" Viis 134.65 190.55 148.00
Item 5.d. Metal End Section
12" "/ea" 55.00 68.00 68.00
15" "/ea" 65.00 85.00 87.00
18" "/ea" 80.00 110.00 113.00
24" "/ea" 110.00 164.00 174.00
30" "/ea" 275.00 430.00 397.00
36" "/ea" 425.00 615.00 569.00
48" "/ea" 1,150.00 1,424.00 1,500.00
54" "/ea" 2,000.00 1,976.00 1,640.00
60" "/ea" 2,500.00 2,965.00 2,400.00
* ADS Bid Comments
Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe 12" - 54" MDOT approved AASHTO
Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe 60" AASHTO
Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe - Perforated with Sock - Sock sold separately as needed
** Cadillac Culvert Bid Comments
12" - 48" Alum Type Il = 14 Gauge
54" - 60" Alum Type Il = 12 Gauge
Culvert bands are extra
Metal End Sections = Galvanized
*** St. Regis Culvert Bid Comments
12" - 48" Alum Type Il = 14 Gauge
54" Alum Type Il = 12 Gauge
60" Alum Type Il = 10 Gauge
All prices are firm for 30 days from bid date, after said time subject to change without notice
Minimum order to include freight is $8500.00
~~ Jensen Bridge Bid Comments
12"-54" Alum Type Il = 14 Gauge
60" Alum Type Il = 12 Gauge
Pricing good for 30 days
Awarded Items
Sealed bids were opened on January 4th, 2022 at 3:00 pm
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