Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2022 Material Bid Tabulations
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2022-06 Cold Patch
Item Description Unit
CP-6 (Stylink) "/ton" No bid
Alternate Material - (UPM) "/ton"
Alternate Material - (QPR High Performance) "/ton" 94.00
Alternate Material - (BMP - 7) "/ton"

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-07 Emulsions
Item Description Unit
Delivered to MCRC
AMS SP "/gal" 2.95
HFRS-2 "/gal" 3.07
FOB/Point of Supply
AMS SP "/gal" 2.05
HFRS-2 "/gal" 2.35
FOB/Point of Supply Location Bay City Alma

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm

Awarded Items

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-08 Pavement Markings
Item Description Unit
Pavement Markings - Estimated miles: 360 +/-
Pavement Marking, waterborne, 4 inch yellow "/Ift" 0.055 0.055 0.058
Pavement Marking, waterborne, 4 inch white "/Ift" 0.054 0.050 0.052
Special Items
Arrows/Special Markings " [sft" 1.80 1.25 3.00
24" Stop Bars "/Ift" 2.50 1.25 2.00
Pavt Mrkg, Thermopl, Rumble Strip "/Ift" No Bid 7.50 *8.00
Pavt Mrkg, Rumble Strip, Remove "/Ift" 3.00 3.00 5.00

*Geveko E-411W

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-09 Aggregates
Can all materials be weighed by approved certified scales? "Yes or No"
Type of units available for haul: "X"
V Bottom X X
Maximum amount that can be furnished per day? "Tons" 2,500 1,500
Item Description Unit
22A 100% Crushed Limestone
Sanford Garage "/ton" 22.00 17.91 18.74 20.80
Clay Pit "/ton" 22.00 18.30 18.74 21.05
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 20.25 18.52 18.74 20.80
Jasper Garage "/ton" 20.50 20.23 20.49 22.55
Northwest Quadrant "/ton" 22.00 21.59 No bid 23.05
Northeast Quadrant "/ton" 22.00 20.82 No bid 21.55
Southwest Quadrant "/ton" 22.00 21.59 No bid 23.05
Southeast Quadrant "/ton" 22.00 20.22 No bid 21.30
23A 100% Crushed Limestone
Sanford Garage "/ton" 22.00 17.91 18.24 20.76
Clay Pit "/ton" 22.00 18.30 18.24 21.01
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 20.25 18.52 18.24 20.76
Jasper Garage "/ton" 20.50 20.23 19.99 22.51
Northwest Quadrant "/ton" 22.00 21.59 No bid 23.01
Northeast Quadrant "/ton" 22.00 20.82 No bid 21.51
Southwest Quadrant "/ton" 22.00 21.59 No bid 23.01
Southeast Quadrant "/ton" 22.00 20.22 No bid 21.26

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-09 Aggregates
22A Road Gravel
Sanford Garage "/ton" 14.24
Clay Pit "/ton" 14.55
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 16.25
Jasper Garage "/ton" 16.25
Northwest Quadrant "/ton" 15.79
Northeast Quadrant "/ton" 17.65
Southwest Quadrant "/ton" 14.90
Southeast Quadrant "/ton" 16.66
23A Road Gravel
Sanford Garage "/ton" 14.24
Clay Pit "/ton" 14.55
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 16.25
Jasper Garage "/ton" 16.25
Northwest Quadrant "/ton" 15.79
Northeast Quadrant "/ton" 17.65
Southwest Quadrant "/ton" 14.90
Southeast Quadrant "/ton" 16.66
2NS Sand
Sanford Garage "/ton" 13.70
Class Il (A) Sand
Sanford Garage "/ton" 7.75
Clay Pit "/ton" 7.75
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 10.00
Jasper Garage "/ton" 7.75
Class 11l Sand
Sanford Garage "/ton" 7.75
Clay Pit "/ton" 7.75

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-09 Aggregates
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 10.00
Jasper Garage "/ton" 7.75
Rip Rap, Plain
Sanford Garage "/ton" 52.67 45.99
Clay Pit "/ton" 52.67 45.74
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 51.14 45.99
Jasper Garage "/ton" 54.97 46.99
Rip Rap, Heavy
Sanford Garage "/ton" 57.92 50.99
Clay Pit "/ton" 57.92 50.74
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 56.39 50.99
Jasper Garage "/ton" 60.22 51.99
3" x 5" Rip Rap
Sanford Garage "/ton" 33.60 31.00
Clay Pit "/ton" 34.15 31.25
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 33.78 31.00
Jasper Garage "/ton" 36.00 32.75
H1 Sealcoat Stone
Sanford Garage "/ton" 27.01
Clay Pit "/ton" 27.70
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 27.24
Jasper Garage "/ton" 30.00
Pickup at Terminal "/ton" No bid
Alternative Material to H1 Sealcoat Stone Traprock/Limestone Blend
Sanford Garage "/ton" 36.75
Clay Pit "/ton" 36.75
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 35.00

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-09 Aggregates
Jasper Garage "/ton" 35.25
Pickup at Terminal "/ton" 29.75
29A Limestone - GRS Backfill
Sanford Garage "/ton" 26.00 24.48 25.25
Clay Pit "/ton" 26.00 24.90 25.25
Ingersoll Garage "/ton" 24.25 24.76 25.25
Jasper Garage "/ton" 24.50 26.30 27.00
Pickup at Terminal "/ton" 19.00{No bid 21.00

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-10 Geotextile Materials
Item Description Unit
Material Only Unit Price Syd/Roll
Geotextile Liner, Non Woven "/roll" No bids No bids
Heavy Geotextile Liner, Non Woven "/roll" No bids No bids
High Strength Woven Polypropylene Fabric "/roll" No bids No bids
Medium Strength Woven Polypropylene Fabric "/roll" No bids No bids
Silt Fence, Fabricated "/roll" No bids No bids
High Velocity Straw Mulch Blanket "/roll" No bids No bids
Single Net Straw Mulch Blanket "/roll" No bids No bids

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-11 Precast Concrete Deck Panel System

Item Description Unit
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 30’ long "lIsum" *60,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 32’ long "l[sum" *71,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 35’ long "lIsum" *70,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 37’ long "l[sum" *76,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 39’ long "Isum" * 82,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 42’ long "lsum" No bid
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 45’ long "Isum" No bid
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 47’ long "lsum" No bid

Set In Stone Comments:
* Bid for complete 8 beam system

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am




Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2022 Material Bid Tabulations

Z S
. 2
S, %, % % P
Contractor/vendor O @%) 5. v(/v :7 9 ?& S,
[ T &% o, ©
3 2 Ci ) & ey
z ® % < 2 S S %
P % 2% %
2022-12 Chip Seal Application
Item Description Unit
Single Chip Seal "/syd" 1.93 1.82 1.93
Double Chip Seal "/syd" 3.53 3.47 3.81
Fog Seal "/syd" 0.36 0.33 0.38
Temporary Raise Pavement Markers, Yellow "each" 1.50 1.00 1.50
Temporary Raise Pavement Markers, White "each" 1.50 1.00 1.50
Alternate to Specified Chip Seal (50/50 Trap/Limestone Blend)
Single Chip Seal "/syd" *#%1.78 **1.67 *1.88
Double Chip Seal "/syd" **%3.28

* Alternate is 50/50 Trap/Limestone Blend
** Alternate is CST Slag
**% Alternate is 50/50 Trap/Limestone Blend

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-13 Overband Crack Fill and HMA Crack Treatment
Item Description Unit
Overband Crack Fill
Overband Crack Fill] "/Roadbed Mile" 4,750.00 No bid 2,875.00 6,850.00 2,700.00
Overband Crack Fill "/Pound" 1.26 1.79 1.14 1.37 1.05
HMA Crack Treatment
HMA Crack Treatment "/Pound" No bid No bid 1.24 1.41 1.05
Awarded Items
Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am 11
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Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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2022-14 Micro-Surface
Item Description Unit
Micro-Surface, Rutfilling Ton 255.00 238.00 325.00
Micro-Surface Syd 4.37 3.48 4.74
Micro-Surface, Single Cse Syd 3.51 2.43 3.92
Temp Raised Pavt Mark, Yellow Each 1.00 1.50 5.00
Temp Raised Pavt Mark, White Each 1.00 1.50 5.00
Awarded Items
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2022 - Large Culverts
Item Description Unit
Aluminized Type Il Corrugated Metal Pipe
72" Diameter, 10 Gauge, 40 Ft Lump Sum 7,576.00 7,223.60 7,578.00
117" x 79" Elliptical, 12 Gauge, 60 Ft Lump Sum 16,599.00 12,968.40 14,322.00
128" x 83" Elliptical, 10 Gauge, 50 Ft Lump Sum 18,200.00 14,094.50 16,247.50
142" x 91" Elliptical, 10 Gauge, 72 Ft Lump Sum 29,304.00 22,410.72 27,802.80

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on March 1, 2022 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 3, 2022 at 9:00 am
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