Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2023 Material Bid Tabulations
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Bid Item 2023-01 Pipe
Item Description Rate
Item 1.a. Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe *

12" Viis 5.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" Viis 8.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" Viis 11.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" Viis 19.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" "/t 27.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" "/t 37.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" Viis 69.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" Viis No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" Viis 96.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 1.b.|] Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe — Perforated w/ Sock No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" Viis 6.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" Viis 9.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" Viis 13.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" Viis 21.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" Viis No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" "/t No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 1.c. Aluminized Type Il Corrugated Metal Pipe ok kK ~r
12" Viis No Bid 12.75 15.60 13.02
15" "/t No Bid 15.80 19.50 15.14
18" Viis No Bid 19.10 23.40 18.36
24" Viis No Bid 25.55 31.20 27.54
30" Viis No Bid 32.50 39.00 32.59
36" Viis No Bid 38.50 46.80 38.44
48" Viis No Bid 54.75 62.40 64.25
54" "/t No Bid 106.95 79.30 75.74
60" Viis No Bid 118.85 87.10 105.26

Item 1.d. Metal End Section
12" "/ea" No Bid 50.00 70.00 59.24
15" "/ea" No Bid 62.00 105.00 75.28
18" "/ea" No Bid 72.00 140.00 98.13
24" "/ea" No Bid 120.00 175.00 149.80
30" "/ea" No Bid 225.00 455.00 342.97
36" "/ea" No Bid 415.00 605.00 491.90
48" "/ea" No Bid 1,150.00 1,400.00 1,320.59
54" "/ea" No Bid 1,500.00 No Bid 1,416.55
60" "/ea" No Bid 1,900.00 No Bid 2,074.50

* ADS Bid Comments

Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe 12" - 48" and 60" HDPE/FT
Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe - Perforated with Sock 12" - 24" HDPE/FT

** Cadillac Culvert Bid Comments
12" - 48" Alum Type Il = 14 Gauge
54" - 60" Alum Type Il = 12 Gauge
Metal End Sections includes hardware

*** St. Regis Culvert Bid Comments

12" - 60" Alum Type Il = 14 Gauge

All prices are firm for 30 days

Minimum order to include freight is $7500.00
$500 for partial loads

~~ Jensen Bridge Bid Comments
12" - 54" Alum Type Il = 14 Gauge
60" Alum Type Il = 12 Gauge
Pricing good for 60 days

No delivery charge or minimum
Terms 1%10, NET 30

Sealed bids were opened on January 17th, 2023 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on January 18th, 2023 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2023-02 Geotextiles & Erosion Control
Item Description Rate
Material Only Unit Price Syd/Roll Unit Price Syd/Roll
Geotextile Liner, Non Woven "/roll" 625.00 500 1,020.00
Heavy Geotextile Liner, Non Woven "/roll" 895.00 500 1,700.00
High Strength Woven Polypropylene Fabric "/roll" 1,188.00 500 1,800.00
Medium Strength Woven Polypropylene Fabric "/roll" 975.00 500 1,300.00
Silt Fence, Fabricated "/roll" 45.00 100 No Bid
High Velocity Straw Mulch Blanket "/roll" 32.50 100 No Bid
Single Net Straw Mulch Blanket "/roll" 28.50 100 No Bid

Sealed bids were opened on January 17th, 2023 at 2:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on January 18th, 2023 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2023-03 Guardrail
Item Description Rate
Steel Beam Guardrail Materials and Installation
Mobilization & Traffic Control (County Road) - Ea "/ea" 2,100.00 500.00
Mobilization & Traffic Control (MDOT Road) - Ea "/ea" 2,100.00 500.00
Guardrail, Rem - Ft /" 5.00 20.00
Guardrail, Curved, Type B - Ft "/f" 54.30 45.00
Guardrail, Curved, Type T - Ft /" 67.20 50.00
Guardrail, Type B - Ft /" 37.60 45.00
Guardrail, Type T - Ft "/t 55.70 50.00
Guardrail, Type MGS-8 - Ft "/ft" 37.60 45.00
Guardrail Post, Culv - Ea "/ea" 649.00 500.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 1B - Ea "fea" 3,318.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 1T - Ea "/ea" 3,699.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2B - Ea "fea" 3,827.00 4,500.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2T - Ea "/ea" 4,208.00 4,500.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2M - Ea "fea" 3,827.00 4,500.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 3B - Ea "/ea" 5,716.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 3T - Ea "fea" 6,097.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type B - Ea "/ea" 925.00 1,500.00
Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type T - Ea "fea" 1,025.00 1,500.00
Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type MGS - Ea "/ea" 925.00 1,500.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M1 - Ea "/ea" 3,288.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M2 - Ea "/ea" 3,727.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M3 - Ea "/ea" 3,968.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M4 - Ea "/ea" 3,661.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M5 - Ea "/ea" 4,100.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M6 - Ea "/ea" 4,261.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M7 - Ea "/ea" 3,785.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M8 - Ea "/ea" 4,232.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M9 - Ea "/ea" 4,385.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T1 - Ea "/ea" 2,540.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T2 - Ea "/ea" 2,784.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T3 - Ea "/ea" 3,513.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T4 - Ea "/ea" 2,699.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T5 - Ea "/ea" 3,337.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T6 - Ea "/ea" 2,928.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Median - Ea "/ea" 2,372.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Reflector - Ea "fea" 6.00 10.00
Item 3.b Nu-Guard-31 Roadside Barrier Mat & Install

Nu-Guard Rib-Bak, 5 |b. x 6.5' "/ea" 32.00 225.00
Nu-Guard Rib-Bak, 5 Ib. x 8.5' "/ea" 38.00 250.00
Nu-Guard, Washer, 3.5" D "/ea" 1.75 8.00
Nu-Guard-31 System, Installation County Wide Per

. Viis 22.15 70.00
Lineal Ft.

Sealed bids were opened on January 17th, 2023 at 2:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on January 18th, 2023 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2023-04  Dust Control and Anti-Icing Product
Item Description Rate
% Liqui - - - - P No Bid '
Applied County 38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Applied Continuous /gal o Bi 0.700
Wide - - - - i
Mineral Well Brine Applied Continuous "/gal" 0.194 No Bid
o N - - N . n " N Bd .
Bulk Delivery to 38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Delivered /gal o Bi 0.660
MCRC Sanford - - -
Mineral Well Brine Delivered "/gal" 0.172 0.550
38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Picked up at Terminal "/gal" No Bid No Bid
Material Only
Mineral Well Brine Picked up at Terminal "/gal" 0.080 No Bid

Sealed bids were opened on January 17th, 2023 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on January 18th, 2023 at 9:00 am

* Based on 9,500
gallon loads

Based on 7,000-
9,000 gallon loads

Liquid Calcium Alternate - 32%



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2023 Material Bid Tabulations

Contractor/vendor

Bid Item 2023-05 Precast Concrete Deck Panel System

Item Description Unit
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 30’ long "lsum" $63,750.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 32’ long "lsum" $72,500.0
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 35’ long "lsum" $70,500.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 37’ long "lsum" $83,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 39’ long "lsum" $102,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 42’ long "lsum" No Bid
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 45’ long "lsum" No Bid
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 47’ long "lsum" No Bid

Set In Stone Comments:

* Bid for complete 8 beam system

Does not include charges for skews or other modifications

Sealed bids were opened on January 17th, 2023 at 2:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on January 18th, 2023 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2023-06 Cold Patch
Item Description Unit
CP-6 (Stylink) "/ton"
Alternate Material - (UPM) "/ton" 131.05
Alternate Material - (QPR High Performance) "/ton" 123.00
Alternate Material - (BMP - 7) "/ton"

Sealed bids were opened on January 17th, 2023 at 2:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on January 18th, 2023 at 9:00 am
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