Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2024 Material Bid Tabulations - January 16, 2024
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Bid Item 2024-01 Signs and Posts
Description Unit
Signs
Sign, Type llIA Sft 6.33 7.00
Sign, Type IIIB Sft 6.33 7.00
Sign, Type VB Sft 7.39 10.00
3 LB/FT Steel Posts, Delivered in April 2024, Quantity: 100
4.5 FT - Delivered in April 2024 Ea *19.54 18.69
3 LB/FT Steel Posts, As Needed
45FT Ea 15.20 18.69
6 FT Ea 19.59 24.42
7FT Ea 22.86 28.49
8 FT Ea 26.12 32.56
9FT Ea 29.39 36.63
10 FT Ea 32.65 40.70
12 FT Ea 39.18 48.84
13 FT Ea 42.45 52.91
14 FT Ea 45.71 57.00
1IS5FT Ea 48.98 61.05
16 FT Ea 52.24 65.12
3 LB/FT Galvanized Steel Posts, Delivered in April 2024, Quantity:
100
14 FT - Delivered in April 2024 Ea *59.40 57.00
3 LB/FT Galvanized Steel Posts, As Needed
45FT Ea 19.54 18.69
6 FT Ea 25.46 24.42
7FT Ea 29.70 28.49
8FT Ea 33.94 32.56
9FT Ea 38.18 36.63

Sealed bids were opened on January 16th, 2024 at 2:00 pm
Bids will be awarded at the regular board meeting on January 17th, 2024 at 9:00 am lof5
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Bid Item 2024-01 Signs and Posts
Description Unit
10 FT Ea 42.43 40.70
12 FT Ea 50.91 48.84
13 FT Ea 55.15 52.91
14 FT Ea 59.40 57.00
1IS5FT Ea 63.64 61.05
16 FT Ea 67.88 65.12
Specialty Posts, As Needed
7 FT Steel Delineator Post Ea 12.03 12.60
6 FT Flexible Delineator Post w/ 3"x12" HIP Sheeting Ea 46.20 45.00
Plastic Drum, Fluorescent, Furn, As Needed
Plastic Drum, Fluorescent, Furn Ea 120.15 85.00
Channelizing Device, 42 inch, Fluorescent, Furn, Delivered in April
2024, Quantity: 100
Channelizing Device, 42 inch, Fluorescent, Furn, Delivered |n2A(§erl: Ea £3.94 £3.40 Awardediiterms

* This comment is for the 4.5' and 14" posts delivered in April. The posts take 90-120 days to arrive from
the manufacturer. Delivery in April is possible depending on when the order is placed.

Sealed bids were opened on January 16th, 2024 at 2:00 pm
Bids will be awarded at the regular board meeting on January 17th, 2024 at 9:00 am 20f5
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Bid Item 2024-02 Brush Spray
Description Rate
Brush Control Rbmi 161.94 153.00 90.67 70.00
Cattail Control Gal 4.73 2.69 2.00 1.25
Phragmites Control Gal 4.73 2.69 2.00 1.75
Japanese Knotweed Control Gal 4.73 2.69 2.00 1.75
Guardrail Vegetation Control Ft 0.21 0.08 0.09 0.10

Sealed bids were opened on January 16th, 2024 at 2:00 pm

Awarded Items

Bids will be awarded at the regular board meeting on January 17th, 2024 at 9:00 am

30of5



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2024 Material Bid Tabulations - January 16, 2024

2 S
7)) <. o
e _% )
Contractor/vendor 2 % % % o % £ %
%% % 2 %% % <
% % % % % 4
L% % o © >
Bid Item 2024-03 Pipe
Description Rate
Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe
12" Diameter Ft *5.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" Diameter Ft *8.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" Diameter Ft *11.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" Diameter Ft *19.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" Diameter Ft *27.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" Diameter Ft *37.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" Diameter Ft *80.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" Diameter Ft No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" Diameter Ft *117.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Corrugated Dual Wall Plastic Pipe — Perforated with Sock
12" Diameter Ft **6.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" Diameter Ft ** 8.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" Diameter Ft **13.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" Diameter Ft **21.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" Diameter Ft ** 29,58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" Diameter Ft ** 39,03 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aluminized Type Il Corrugated Metal Pipe
12" Diameter Ft No Bid ~11.85 A 14.30 13.80
15" Diameter Ft No Bid ~14.70 N17.75 17.25
18" Diameter Ft No Bid ~17.75 A21.23 20.70
24" Diameter Ft No Bid ~24.00 N 28.68 27.60
30" Diameter Ft No Bid ~29.45 A 36.35 34.50
36" Diameter Ft No Bid ~35.50 N42.40 41.40
48" Diameter Ft No Bid ~ 49,55 A 58.99 57.60
54" Diameter Ft No Bid ~~98.35 AN 99,00 #73.20

Sealed bids were opened on January 16th, 2024 at 2:00 pm
Bids will be awarded at the regular board meeting on January 17th, 2024 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2024-03 Pipe
Description Rate
60" Diameter Ft No Bid ~~108.65 AN 108.90 #80.40
Metal End Section
12" Diameter Ea No Bid 58.00 54.99 70.00
15" Diameter Ea No Bid 65.00 69.99 105.00
18" Diameter Ea No Bid 77.00 91.99 140.00
24" Diameter Ea No Bid 120.00 140.99 175.00
30" Diameter Ea No Bid 225.00 324.99 455.00
36" Diameter Ea No Bid 420.00 465.99 605.00
48" Diameter Ea No Bid 1,600.00 1,255.99 1,400.00
54" Diameter Ea No Bid 2,000.00 1,349.99 1,800.00
60" Diameter Ea No Bid 2,600.00 1,977.99 2,700.00

ADS Bid Comments:
* MDOT Approved
** 2 week lead time

Cadillac Culvert Bid Comments:

~ 14 Gauge
~~12 Gauge - 3" x 1"

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on January 16th, 2024 at 2:00 pm
Bids will be awarded at the regular board meeting on January 17th, 2024 at 9:00 am

Jensen Bridge Bid Comments:

AN 14 Gauge

AN 12 Gauge

Pricing good for 30 days all items
No delivery charge or minimum
Terms 1%10, NET 30

St. Regis Culvert Bid Comments:
#3x1

50f5



